

Law Office of Gregory M. Varner, P.C. (2015)

Post Office Box 338
Ashland, AL 36251

Invoice

Date	Invoice #
4/15/2021	2015466

Bill To
City of Ashland Chelsey Wynn, City Clerk Administrator 83183 Hwy. 9 Ashland, AL 36251

P.O. No.	Terms	Project
	Due upon receipt	

Quantity	Description	Rate	Amount
	CARES Act March 2021	12.50	12.50
	Nuisance Ordinance Attorney Fees	1,987.50	1,987.50
	General Office Attorney Fees	112.50	112.50
	Personnel Questions and Discipline of S. McKemie Attorney Fees	21.50	21.50
	Wynn Building - Lease of Office Space Attorney Fees	28.00	28.00
		Total	\$2,162.00

Client Activity Report (04/15/2021)

Dates: 03/01/2021 - 03/31/2021

City of Ashland

03914-City of Ashland: CARES Act Monies (Jacy Fisher)

Date	Status	User	Description	Note	Quantity	Price	Total
03/05/2021	Unbilled	Greg Varner		Draft instructions to associate about chest compressors	0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50
						Unbilled Total:	0.10 hours, \$12.50
						Matter Total:	0.10 hours, \$12.50

03947-City of Ashland: Nuisance Ordinance (Spencer Waddell)

Date	Status	User	Description	Note	Quantity	Price	Total
03/31/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Call w/ T. Hubbard re: dilapidated building memo and leave VM	0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50
03/30/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Call w/ T. Hubbard re: abatement of dilapidated buildings and leave VM concerning same	0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50
03/23/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Draft memo re: including in dilapidated building memorandum discrimination criteria and lack of necessity for same and compose e-mail to T. Hubbard re: procedures for repairing/demolishing dilapidated buildings	2.50	\$125.00	\$312.50
03/23/2021	Unbilled	Greg Varner		Review memo	0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50
03/22/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Review/revise memo re: repair/demo of dilapidated buildings, assessment of costs, and enforcement of lien	3.60	\$125.00	\$450.00
03/19/2021	Unbilled	Greg Varner		Status Review	0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50
03/19/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Review/revise memo re: repair/demolition of dilapidated buildings that constitute public nuisances, assessment of costs, and enforcement of assessment liens	1.50	\$125.00	\$187.50
03/16/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Draft memo re: abatement of dilapidated buildings and enforcement of assessment lien arising from repair/demolition of the same	1.90	\$125.00	\$237.50
03/15/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Draft memo re: abatement of dilapidated buildings	1.40	\$125.00	\$175.00
03/10/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell		Review/analyze statutes and case law re: abatement of dilapidated buildings and procedural requirements re: same	1.40	\$125.00	\$175.00

03/08/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell	Draft memo re: procedures for abatement of dilapidated building that constitutes public nuisance and review/analyze statutes concerning same	1.40	\$125.00	\$175.00
------------	----------	-----------------	--	------	----------	----------

03/05/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell	Draft memo re: abatement of dilapidated buildings that constitute public nuisances and research/analyze statutes re: same	1.80	\$125.00	\$225.00
------------	----------	-----------------	---	------	----------	----------

Unbilled Total: 15.90 hours, \$1,987.50

Matter Total: 15.90 hours, \$1,987.50

03996-City of Ashland: General Office

Date	Status	User	Description	Note	Quantity	Price	Total
03/23/2021	Unbilled	Spencer Waddell	Review federal court information and pleadings re: Officer Shepherd and compose e-mail to chief concerning same		0.40	\$125.00	\$50.00
03/14/2021	Unbilled	Jacy Fisher	Email from paralegal re: personnel manual		0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50
03/08/2021	Unbilled	Tyler Sims	Email personnel manual to paralegal and conference with paralegal		0.20	\$125.00	\$25.00
03/06/2021	Unbilled	Jacy Fisher	Conference with Greg re: whistleblower policy; notes to file		0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50
03/06/2021	Unbilled	Jacy Fisher	review of personnel manual; Update task list		0.10	\$125.00	\$12.50

Unbilled Total: 0.90 hours, \$112.50

Matter Total: 0.90 hours, \$112.50

04041-City of Ashland: Personnel Question about Discipline of Sara McKemie (Jacy Fisher)

Date	Status	User	Description	Note	Quantity	Price	Total
03/01/2021	Unbilled	Greg Varner	Teleconference with mayor		0.10	\$215.00	\$21.50

Unbilled Total: 0.10 hours, \$21.50

Matter Total: 0.10 hours, \$21.50

04042-City of Ashland: Renting of Wynn Building (Tyler Sims)

Date	Status	User	Description	Note	Quantity	Price	Total
03/01/2021	Unbilled	Tyler Sims	Call with Mayor Fetner; brief background check on potential renter		0.20	\$140.00	\$28.00

Unbilled Total: 0.20 hours, \$28.00

Matter Total: 0.20 hours, \$28.00

Client Total: 17.20 hours, \$2,162.00

Total: 17.20 hours, \$2,162.00